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Message from the Lord given through Joseph Samsa 
 
 

“I am the Good Shepherd and My sheep hear my voice.  And you are 
My people. You are My sheep. And your condition directly reflects on 
Me. I have given you everything you need for life… everything you 
need for prosperity… everything you need to advance.  I am the one 
that leads you beside the still waters.  I am the one that gives you the 
green pastures. I am the one that prepares the table in the presence 
of your enemy’s. But you, My sheep, must partake! You must partake! 
You must listen to My voice… for the world is looking upon you… and 
they see your condition! They see if you’re fearful.  They see if you’re 
weak.  They see your frailties.  But I have given you life and life 
abundantly!  I have paid the price for victory over all things!  
 
So, My sheep… My people – partake of what I have given you! 
Strengthen yourselves through the Word! Strengthen yourselves 
through prayer! Strengthen yourselves through the Spirit that I have 
given you! My Word says, ‘Be strong in your inner man… by the Spirit 
that I have given you… THEN you will be a light shining on a hill!  THEN 
you will be a shining city!  THEN you will be a witness for me.  As they 
look upon you, they will not see you but they will see the Glory of My 
Father.  They will see a People, a Chosen People, set aside.  A royal 
priesthood that will do the work that has been given to Me… and I 
give to you to be that sweet smelling savor of life – that the world 
may smell of you… that the world may touch of you… that those that 
are lost may see the reflection of Me.   In My sheep… in My sheep. 
 
Partake, partake, partake.”  


